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We meet in a warm, 

friendly atmosphere to 

praise and worship the 

Lord Jesus Christ. 

Please do join us 



Bible Studies 

Inbetween Group 

J.A.M. Club  

Church Day Out 



JAM Club 

Youth Activities 

Rainbows, Brownies  
& Guides 



BMS world news 
Issue 2/15 

BMS World Mission is supporting a major new research project to help 
survivors of gender based violence (GBV) after a bloody conflict in the 
Central African Republic. 

Divided communities cannot rebuild trust after a conflict without the truth. 
Recognising the survivors and perpetrators of violence and bringing some 
kind of reconciliation are equally important. It requires painstaking re-
search that is sensitively and professionally delivered.  

BMS is about to embark on such an exercise in the Central African Re-
public (CAR), where one of the bitterest and most violent conflicts in the 
world has left Muslim and Christian communities divided. It has also led to 
hundreds of deaths and left over 200,000 people displaced.  

BMS will be funding a research project to ascertain whether this has been 
like other recent conflicts in sub-Saharan Africa where sexual violence 
has been systematically used as a weapon of war. “If you want to extend 
terror, if you want to project dominance over your enemies in that conflict, 
by using sexual violence and rape you are projecting power against your 
enemy,” says BMS Manager for Mission Projects Steve Sanderson.  

A team of local researchers will be trained on how to collect accurate in-
formation from survivors. Once completed, BMS and our partner Tear-
fund, will analyse the data. It is hoped that this will be foundational to a 
reconciliation process in CAR, bringing survivors and perpetrators togeth-
er, along with conflicting religious communities. It could be a powerful tool 
not only for survivors in CAR but globally as we aim to restore the dignity 
of women and girls hurt by GBV.  

BMS’ support of this project has been inspired by our Dignity initiative to 
end gender based violence, our collaboration with other Christian agen-
cies and denominations in the We Will Speak Out Coalition, and our par-
ticipation in the Global Summit to End Sexual Violence in Conflict in Lon-



don in June 2014. 

Saving limbs and lives in Chad 

BMS World Mission doctors in Chad saved a seven-year-old from an un-
necessary amputation. 

Sue White, a BMS nurse, was on duty when Idriss arrived at Guinebor II 
Hospital (G2) in severe pain because of an abscess that had left dead and 
dying tissue from his knee to his buttock. Two weeks before coming to G2, 
Idriss had received an injection in his leg at another clinic and unfortunate-
ly it became infected. Initially, his father took him to the general hospital in 
N’Djamena, but they only stayed a few days because the doctors there 
wanted to amputate Idriss’ leg.  

Once admitted to G2, he was given pain killers, antibiotics and a blood 
transfusion before the dead tissue could be removed. “There is no blood 
bank here,” says Sue. “People have to rely on relatives with the same 
blood type to come forward.” Meaning Idriss had to wait days because his 
family had to travel to the hospital. Mark Hotchkin, a BMS doctor, success-
fully performed the surgery and Idriss is recovering nicely.  

It is easy to take things like blood banks for granted, since they are easily 
accessible in the West. In Chad, G2 and the skilled staff there are a bea-
con of hope for the sick. 

Recovery and relief  

Your generous gifts enables us to respond to conflict and disaster situa-
tions. Thank you! 
 
Central African Republic, £8,000 
 
BMS and Tearfund will be collaborating to conduct an intensive research 
project into the conflict that tore this country apart. Their focus will be the 
effects and range of GBV during the twelve months of violence. 
 
Iraq, £5,613 
 
A relief grant to help internally displaced persons in Iraq who have been 
forced to flee their homes because of the threat posed by Islamic State.  
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